
Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements UnitPrice TotalCost

1
#1-1 Motorcycle Jacket: Taylor Leather Item #4473    $ 1,280.0 4 EACH Black Leath                                 Certified Dealer. $ 357 $ 1,428.0
#1-2 Motorcycle Rain Jacket: Blauer #9970-2 $ 1,855.0 7 EACH Color Dark                                                   Certified Dealer. No Bid No Bid
#1-3 Motorcycle Pant: Blauer #9972 $ 648 4 EACH Color Dark Certified Dealer. No Bid No Bid
#1-4 Fur Trooper Hat: Keystone Y5 $ 912 48 EACH Color Dark     x $ 26 $ 1,248.0

#1-5 TDU Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item #72002  $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting. $ 65 $ 780

#1-6 Tactlite TDU Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item   $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting. $ 62 $ 744

#1-7 TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Style #74003 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting. $ 44 $ 1,056.0

#1-8 Tactlite Pro Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting. $ 64 $ 768

#1-9 Tactlite Pro Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting. $ 62 $ 744

#1-10 Taclite TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Item #74280 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting. $ 44 $ 1,056.0

0
$ 0

Fairfield Uniform 
Company
$ 46,958.0



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements UnitPrice TotalCost

1

0
$ 0

Fairfield Uniform 
Company
$ 46,958.0

#1-11 Canvas Pant: 5.11 Item #74251 $ 0 12 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting. $ 44 $ 528
#1-12 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160 /Regular size $ 2,000.0 100 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer. No Bid No Bid
#1-13 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160/ oversize $ 500 25 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer. No Bid No Bid
#1-14 Loose Fit Tee: 5.11 Item #40007 $ 0 30 EACH Color Dark                                         Alternate Brands Accepted. $ 39 $ 1,170.0
#1-15 Job Shirt: 5.11 Item #72314 $ 0 20 EACH Color Dark                       Certified Dealer. $ 64 $ 1,280.0
#1-16 Training Polo Shirt: Vertx Item #VTX4000P $ 0 15 EACH Color Black                                   May require on site fitting. $ 55 $ 825

#1-17 Traning Pant: 5.11 Stryke Pant Item #74369 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be    
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer $ 62 $ 1,240.0

#1-18 Special Unit Polo Bomb Squad: 5.11 Item #410$ 0 20 EACH Left Chest.      
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer $ 48 $ 960

#1-19 Special Unit Polo Hostage Negotiation: 5.11 It  $ 0 20 EACH Right Chest          
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer $ 64 $ 1,280.0

#1-20 Performance Polo: 5.11 Item #71049 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be                                         

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting. $ 55 $ 1,100.0

#1-21 Dive Shorts: 5.11 Item #733078 $ 0 15 EACH Color to be Certified Dealer. $ 44 $ 660
#1-22 Work Cap: Red Kap Item #HB20 $ 0 12 EACH Color Navy                   Alternate Brands Accepted. No Bid No Bid
#1-23 SWAT Top: CRYE Item G3 Combat Shirt $ 0 7 EACH Color Rang    x $ 205 $ 1,435.0
#1-24 SWAT/Training Bottoms: CRYE Item G3 Comba  $ 0 15 EACH Color Rang    x $ 299 $ 4,485.0
#1-25 Protective Eyewear: Oakley Standard Issue Ba       $ 0 7 EACH Black Fram        x No Bid No Bid
#1-26 POLICE Patch: 3.5" wide x 2" high $ 250 25 EACH Color Black                             x $ 10 $ 250
#1-27 POLICE Patch: 7" wide x 5" high $ 375 25 EACH Color Black                             x $ 15 $ 375
#1-28 Work Tee: Hanes Beefy Tee. $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x $ 15 $ 180
#1-29 Work Pocket Tee: Hanes Beefy Pocket Tee $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x $ 21 $ 252
#1-30 Work Sweatshirt: Hanes Comfortblend $ 180 12 EACH Color Navy                  x $ 28 $ 336
#1-31 Work Short Sleeve: Dickies Item #WS675 $ 264 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x No Bid No Bid
#1-32 Work Long Sleeve: Dickies Item #WL675 $ 288 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x $ 30 $ 360



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements UnitPrice TotalCost

1

0
$ 0

Fairfield Uniform 
Company
$ 46,958.0

#1-33 Work Pant: Dickies Item #874 $ 480 20 EACH Color Dark   x $ 24 $ 480
#1-34 Work Flat Front Pant $ 560 20 EACH Color Dark       All Brands Considered. $ 28 $ 560
#1-35 Work Jacket: 5.11 Item #48001 3 in 1 Aggresso$ 0 5 PAIR Color Dark                  Certified Dealer. $ 228 $ 1,140.0
#1-36 Work Rain Jacket: 5.11 Item #48003 $ 0 5 EACH Color Hi-Vis  Certified Dealer. $ 228 $ 1,140.0

#1-37 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Summer Weig$ 3,000.0 10 EACH Color Dark                    

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid. No Bid No Bid

#1-38 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay All Season We$ 2,880.0 10 EACH Color Dark                   

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid. No Bid No Bid

#1-39 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Winter Weigh$ 3,080.0 10 EACH Color Dark                      

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid. No Bid No Bid

#1-40 Plainclothes Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                            
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted. $ 65 $ 780

#1-41 Raid Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                                   
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted. $ 78 $ 936

#1-42 Shell Jacket: 5.11 Item #48343 $ 0 4 EACH Color Black Certified Dealer. $ 100 $ 400
#1-43 Cycling Pants: Supplex Olympic Item #OCP588$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand. $ 129 $ 3,225.0
#1-44 Cycling Pants: Waterproof Olympic Item #OCP$ 1,125.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand. $ 155 $ 3,875.0
#1-45 Hollywood Shorts: Olympic Item #OHS147 $ 1,025.0 25 EACH Color Dark   Olympic Brand. $ 79 $ 1,975.0
#1-46 Cycling Jacket w/ Liner: Olympic Item #ONY67$ 1,365.0 7 EACH Color Roya                                            Olympic Brand. $ 376 $ 2,632.0
#1-47 Short Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand. $ 103 $ 2,575.0
#1-48 Long Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,550.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand. $ 108 $ 2,700.0



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-1 Motorcycle Jacket: Taylor Leather Item #4473    $ 1,280.0 4 EACH Black Leath                                 Certified Dealer.
#1-2 Motorcycle Rain Jacket: Blauer #9970-2 $ 1,855.0 7 EACH Color Dark                                                   Certified Dealer.
#1-3 Motorcycle Pant: Blauer #9972 $ 648 4 EACH Color Dark Certified Dealer.
#1-4 Fur Trooper Hat: Keystone Y5 $ 912 48 EACH Color Dark     x

#1-5 TDU Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item #72002  $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-6 Tactlite TDU Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item   $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-7 TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Style #74003 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.

#1-8 Tactlite Pro Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-9 Tactlite Pro Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-10 Taclite TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Item #74280 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.

UnitPrice TotalCost

$ 320 $ 1,280.0
$ 265 $ 1,855.0
$ 162 $ 648
$ 19 $ 912

$ 0 $ 0

$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0

$ 0 $ 0

$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0

0
$ 0

Horwitz Uniforms
$ 28,818.0



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-11 Canvas Pant: 5.11 Item #74251 $ 0 12 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.
#1-12 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160 /Regular size $ 2,000.0 100 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer.
#1-13 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160/ oversize $ 500 25 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer.
#1-14 Loose Fit Tee: 5.11 Item #40007 $ 0 30 EACH Color Dark                                         Alternate Brands Accepted.
#1-15 Job Shirt: 5.11 Item #72314 $ 0 20 EACH Color Dark                       Certified Dealer.
#1-16 Training Polo Shirt: Vertx Item #VTX4000P $ 0 15 EACH Color Black                                   May require on site fitting.

#1-17 Traning Pant: 5.11 Stryke Pant Item #74369 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be    
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-18 Special Unit Polo Bomb Squad: 5.11 Item #410$ 0 20 EACH Left Chest.      
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-19 Special Unit Polo Hostage Negotiation: 5.11 It  $ 0 20 EACH Right Chest          
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-20 Performance Polo: 5.11 Item #71049 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be                                         

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-21 Dive Shorts: 5.11 Item #733078 $ 0 15 EACH Color to be Certified Dealer.
#1-22 Work Cap: Red Kap Item #HB20 $ 0 12 EACH Color Navy                   Alternate Brands Accepted.
#1-23 SWAT Top: CRYE Item G3 Combat Shirt $ 0 7 EACH Color Rang    x
#1-24 SWAT/Training Bottoms: CRYE Item G3 Comba  $ 0 15 EACH Color Rang    x
#1-25 Protective Eyewear: Oakley Standard Issue Ba       $ 0 7 EACH Black Fram        x
#1-26 POLICE Patch: 3.5" wide x 2" high $ 250 25 EACH Color Black                             x
#1-27 POLICE Patch: 7" wide x 5" high $ 375 25 EACH Color Black                             x
#1-28 Work Tee: Hanes Beefy Tee. $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-29 Work Pocket Tee: Hanes Beefy Pocket Tee $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-30 Work Sweatshirt: Hanes Comfortblend $ 180 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-31 Work Short Sleeve: Dickies Item #WS675 $ 264 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x
#1-32 Work Long Sleeve: Dickies Item #WL675 $ 288 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x

UnitPrice TotalCost

0
$ 0

Horwitz Uniforms
$ 28,818.0

$ 0 $ 0
$ 22 $ 2,200.0
$ 22 $ 550
$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0

$ 0 $ 0

$ 0 $ 0

$ 0 $ 0

$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0
$ 15 $ 375
$ 18 $ 450
$ 14 $ 168
$ 14 $ 168
$ 15 $ 180
$ 22 $ 264
$ 24 $ 288



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-33 Work Pant: Dickies Item #874 $ 480 20 EACH Color Dark   x
#1-34 Work Flat Front Pant $ 560 20 EACH Color Dark       All Brands Considered.
#1-35 Work Jacket: 5.11 Item #48001 3 in 1 Aggresso$ 0 5 PAIR Color Dark                  Certified Dealer.
#1-36 Work Rain Jacket: 5.11 Item #48003 $ 0 5 EACH Color Hi-Vis  Certified Dealer.

#1-37 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Summer Weig$ 3,000.0 10 EACH Color Dark                    

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-38 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay All Season We$ 2,880.0 10 EACH Color Dark                   

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-39 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Winter Weigh$ 3,080.0 10 EACH Color Dark                      

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-40 Plainclothes Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                            
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted.

#1-41 Raid Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                                   
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted.

#1-42 Shell Jacket: 5.11 Item #48343 $ 0 4 EACH Color Black Certified Dealer.
#1-43 Cycling Pants: Supplex Olympic Item #OCP588$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand.
#1-44 Cycling Pants: Waterproof Olympic Item #OCP$ 1,125.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand.
#1-45 Hollywood Shorts: Olympic Item #OHS147 $ 1,025.0 25 EACH Color Dark   Olympic Brand.
#1-46 Cycling Jacket w/ Liner: Olympic Item #ONY67$ 1,365.0 7 EACH Color Roya                                            Olympic Brand.
#1-47 Short Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand.
#1-48 Long Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,550.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand.

UnitPrice TotalCost

0
$ 0

Horwitz Uniforms
$ 28,818.0

$ 32 $ 640
$ 32 $ 640
$ 0 $ 0
$ 0 $ 0

$ 300 $ 3,000.0

$ 288 $ 2,880.0

$ 308 $ 3,080.0

$ 35 $ 420

$ 35 $ 420
$ 0 $ 0
$ 52 $ 1,300.0
$ 45 $ 1,125.0
$ 41 $ 1,025.0
$ 300 $ 2,100.0
$ 52 $ 1,300.0
$ 62 $ 1,550.0



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-1 Motorcycle Jacket: Taylor Leather Item #4473    $ 1,280.0 4 EACH Black Leath                                 Certified Dealer.
#1-2 Motorcycle Rain Jacket: Blauer #9970-2 $ 1,855.0 7 EACH Color Dark                                                   Certified Dealer.
#1-3 Motorcycle Pant: Blauer #9972 $ 648 4 EACH Color Dark Certified Dealer.
#1-4 Fur Trooper Hat: Keystone Y5 $ 912 48 EACH Color Dark     x

#1-5 TDU Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item #72002  $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-6 Tactlite TDU Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item   $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-7 TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Style #74003 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.

#1-8 Tactlite Pro Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-9 Tactlite Pro Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-10 Taclite TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Item #74280 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.

UnitPrice TotalCost

$ 368 $ 1,472.0
$ 290 $ 2,030.0
$ 180 $ 720
No Bid No Bid

$ 95 $ 1,140.0

$ 95 $ 1,140.0
$ 55 $ 1,320.0

$ 95 $ 1,140.0

$ 93 $ 1,116.0
No Bid No Bid

0
$ 0

New England 
Uniform Co. LLC

$ 39,169.0



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-11 Canvas Pant: 5.11 Item #74251 $ 0 12 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.
#1-12 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160 /Regular size $ 2,000.0 100 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer.
#1-13 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160/ oversize $ 500 25 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer.
#1-14 Loose Fit Tee: 5.11 Item #40007 $ 0 30 EACH Color Dark                                         Alternate Brands Accepted.
#1-15 Job Shirt: 5.11 Item #72314 $ 0 20 EACH Color Dark                       Certified Dealer.
#1-16 Training Polo Shirt: Vertx Item #VTX4000P $ 0 15 EACH Color Black                                   May require on site fitting.

#1-17 Traning Pant: 5.11 Stryke Pant Item #74369 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be    
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-18 Special Unit Polo Bomb Squad: 5.11 Item #410$ 0 20 EACH Left Chest.      
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-19 Special Unit Polo Hostage Negotiation: 5.11 It  $ 0 20 EACH Right Chest          
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-20 Performance Polo: 5.11 Item #71049 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be                                         

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-21 Dive Shorts: 5.11 Item #733078 $ 0 15 EACH Color to be Certified Dealer.
#1-22 Work Cap: Red Kap Item #HB20 $ 0 12 EACH Color Navy                   Alternate Brands Accepted.
#1-23 SWAT Top: CRYE Item G3 Combat Shirt $ 0 7 EACH Color Rang    x
#1-24 SWAT/Training Bottoms: CRYE Item G3 Comba  $ 0 15 EACH Color Rang    x
#1-25 Protective Eyewear: Oakley Standard Issue Ba       $ 0 7 EACH Black Fram        x
#1-26 POLICE Patch: 3.5" wide x 2" high $ 250 25 EACH Color Black                             x
#1-27 POLICE Patch: 7" wide x 5" high $ 375 25 EACH Color Black                             x
#1-28 Work Tee: Hanes Beefy Tee. $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-29 Work Pocket Tee: Hanes Beefy Pocket Tee $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-30 Work Sweatshirt: Hanes Comfortblend $ 180 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-31 Work Short Sleeve: Dickies Item #WS675 $ 264 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x
#1-32 Work Long Sleeve: Dickies Item #WL675 $ 288 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x

UnitPrice TotalCost

0
$ 0

New England 
Uniform Co. LLC

$ 39,169.0

No Bid No Bid
$ 20 $ 2,000.0
$ 20 $ 500
No Bid No Bid
$ 99 $ 1,980.0
$ 64 $ 960

$ 63 $ 1,260.0

$ 80 $ 1,600.0

$ 80 $ 1,600.0

$ 85 $ 1,700.0
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-33 Work Pant: Dickies Item #874 $ 480 20 EACH Color Dark   x
#1-34 Work Flat Front Pant $ 560 20 EACH Color Dark       All Brands Considered.
#1-35 Work Jacket: 5.11 Item #48001 3 in 1 Aggresso$ 0 5 PAIR Color Dark                  Certified Dealer.
#1-36 Work Rain Jacket: 5.11 Item #48003 $ 0 5 EACH Color Hi-Vis  Certified Dealer.

#1-37 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Summer Weig$ 3,000.0 10 EACH Color Dark                    

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-38 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay All Season We$ 2,880.0 10 EACH Color Dark                   

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-39 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Winter Weigh$ 3,080.0 10 EACH Color Dark                      

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-40 Plainclothes Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                            
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted.

#1-41 Raid Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                                   
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted.

#1-42 Shell Jacket: 5.11 Item #48343 $ 0 4 EACH Color Black Certified Dealer.
#1-43 Cycling Pants: Supplex Olympic Item #OCP588$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand.
#1-44 Cycling Pants: Waterproof Olympic Item #OCP$ 1,125.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand.
#1-45 Hollywood Shorts: Olympic Item #OHS147 $ 1,025.0 25 EACH Color Dark   Olympic Brand.
#1-46 Cycling Jacket w/ Liner: Olympic Item #ONY67$ 1,365.0 7 EACH Color Roya                                            Olympic Brand.
#1-47 Short Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand.
#1-48 Long Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,550.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand.

UnitPrice TotalCost

0
$ 0

New England 
Uniform Co. LLC

$ 39,169.0

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$ 210 $ 1,050.0
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$ 119 $ 1,428.0

$ 119 $ 1,428.0
$ 155 $ 620
$ 102 $ 2,550.0
$ 102 $ 2,550.0
$ 62 $ 1,550.0
$ 195 $ 1,365.0
$ 96 $ 2,400.0
$ 102 $ 2,550.0



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-1 Motorcycle Jacket: Taylor Leather Item #4473    $ 1,280.0 4 EACH Black Leath                                 Certified Dealer.
#1-2 Motorcycle Rain Jacket: Blauer #9970-2 $ 1,855.0 7 EACH Color Dark                                                   Certified Dealer.
#1-3 Motorcycle Pant: Blauer #9972 $ 648 4 EACH Color Dark Certified Dealer.
#1-4 Fur Trooper Hat: Keystone Y5 $ 912 48 EACH Color Dark     x

#1-5 TDU Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item #72002  $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-6 Tactlite TDU Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item   $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-7 TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Style #74003 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.

#1-8 Tactlite Pro Style Long Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-9 Tactlite Pro Style Short Sleeve Shirt: 5.11 Item $ 0 12 EACH Color to be                                              

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-10 Taclite TDU Style Pant: 5.11 Item #74280 $ 0 24 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.

UnitPrice TotalCost

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$ 65 $ 780
$ 40 $ 960

$ 60 $ 720

$ 60 $ 720
$ 39 $ 936

0
$ 0

Tactical Police Gear 
LLC

$ 6,734.0



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-11 Canvas Pant: 5.11 Item #74251 $ 0 12 EACH Color to be May require on site fitting.
#1-12 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160 /Regular size $ 2,000.0 100 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer.
#1-13 Skull Cap: Blauer Item #160/ oversize $ 500 25 EACH Dark Navy.                                  Certified Dealer.
#1-14 Loose Fit Tee: 5.11 Item #40007 $ 0 30 EACH Color Dark                                         Alternate Brands Accepted.
#1-15 Job Shirt: 5.11 Item #72314 $ 0 20 EACH Color Dark                       Certified Dealer.
#1-16 Training Polo Shirt: Vertx Item #VTX4000P $ 0 15 EACH Color Black                                   May require on site fitting.

#1-17 Traning Pant: 5.11 Stryke Pant Item #74369 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be    
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-18 Special Unit Polo Bomb Squad: 5.11 Item #410$ 0 20 EACH Left Chest.      
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-19 Special Unit Polo Hostage Negotiation: 5.11 It  $ 0 20 EACH Right Chest          
All Sizes to be available by 
Certified 5.11 Dealer

#1-20 Performance Polo: 5.11 Item #71049 $ 0 20 EACH Color to be                                         

This item designated for Special 
Unit(s) within the department. 
Award may spread across 
several styles of customization. 
May require on site fitting.

#1-21 Dive Shorts: 5.11 Item #733078 $ 0 15 EACH Color to be Certified Dealer.
#1-22 Work Cap: Red Kap Item #HB20 $ 0 12 EACH Color Navy                   Alternate Brands Accepted.
#1-23 SWAT Top: CRYE Item G3 Combat Shirt $ 0 7 EACH Color Rang    x
#1-24 SWAT/Training Bottoms: CRYE Item G3 Comba  $ 0 15 EACH Color Rang    x
#1-25 Protective Eyewear: Oakley Standard Issue Ba       $ 0 7 EACH Black Fram        x
#1-26 POLICE Patch: 3.5" wide x 2" high $ 250 25 EACH Color Black                             x
#1-27 POLICE Patch: 7" wide x 5" high $ 375 25 EACH Color Black                             x
#1-28 Work Tee: Hanes Beefy Tee. $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-29 Work Pocket Tee: Hanes Beefy Pocket Tee $ 168 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-30 Work Sweatshirt: Hanes Comfortblend $ 180 12 EACH Color Navy                  x
#1-31 Work Short Sleeve: Dickies Item #WS675 $ 264 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x
#1-32 Work Long Sleeve: Dickies Item #WL675 $ 288 12 EACH Dark Navy.                     x

UnitPrice TotalCost

0
$ 0

Tactical Police Gear 
LLC

$ 6,734.0

$ 39 $ 468
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$ 15 $ 450
No Bid No Bid
$ 60 $ 900

No Bid No Bid

$ 40 $ 800

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid



Solicitation Name: Police Uniforms-Special Units
Solicitation #:70205017 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasu CustomizatRequirements

1
#1-33 Work Pant: Dickies Item #874 $ 480 20 EACH Color Dark   x
#1-34 Work Flat Front Pant $ 560 20 EACH Color Dark       All Brands Considered.
#1-35 Work Jacket: 5.11 Item #48001 3 in 1 Aggresso$ 0 5 PAIR Color Dark                  Certified Dealer.
#1-36 Work Rain Jacket: 5.11 Item #48003 $ 0 5 EACH Color Hi-Vis  Certified Dealer.

#1-37 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Summer Weig$ 3,000.0 10 EACH Color Dark                    

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-38 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay All Season We$ 2,880.0 10 EACH Color Dark                   

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-39 Motorcycle Breeches: Peter Jay Winter Weigh$ 3,080.0 10 EACH Color Dark                      

Quantity will vary across weight 
of all Motorcycle Breeches 
appearing on this bid.

#1-40 Plainclothes Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                            
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted.

#1-41 Raid Jacket: 5.11 Item #48052 $ 420 12 EACH Color Black                                   
Certified Dealer. And Alternate 
Brands Accepted.

#1-42 Shell Jacket: 5.11 Item #48343 $ 0 4 EACH Color Black Certified Dealer.
#1-43 Cycling Pants: Supplex Olympic Item #OCP588$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand.
#1-44 Cycling Pants: Waterproof Olympic Item #OCP$ 1,125.0 25 EACH Color Dark Olympic Brand.
#1-45 Hollywood Shorts: Olympic Item #OHS147 $ 1,025.0 25 EACH Color Dark   Olympic Brand.
#1-46 Cycling Jacket w/ Liner: Olympic Item #ONY67$ 1,365.0 7 EACH Color Roya                                            Olympic Brand.
#1-47 Short Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,300.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand.
#1-48 Long Sleeve Bike Polo Shirt: Olympic Item #CM$ 1,550.0 25 EACH Color Roya                                 Olympic Brand.

UnitPrice TotalCost

0
$ 0

Tactical Police Gear 
LLC

$ 6,734.0
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