
Solicitation Name: Police Uniform
Solicitation #:7020516 Total Cost
Closed: 10/22/2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest QuantityReUnitMeasuCustomization Requirements UnitPrice TotalCost UnitPrice TotalCost UnitPrice TotalCost

1

#1-1
M+B38:F46ale Trouser Class A Dark 
Navy: Blauer Item #8560T $ 2,680.0 40 EACH

Hem as requested sizes 28 - 
54

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 67 $ 2,680.0 $ 70.85 $ 2,834.0

#1-2
Male Trouser Cargo Dark Navy: 
Blauer Item #8567T $ 5,680.0 80 EACH

Hem as requested sizes 28 - 
54

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 71 $ 5,680.0 $ 75.15 $ 6,012.0

#1-3
Female Trouser Class A Dark Navy: 
Blauer Item #8560WT $ 1,340.0 20 EACH

Hem as requested sizes 2 - 
28

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 67 $ 1,340.0 $ 70.85 $ 1,417.0

#1-4
Female Trouser Cargo Dark Navy: 
Blauer Item #8567WT $ 2,840.0 40 EACH

Hem as requested sizes 2 - 
28

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 71 $ 2,840.0 $ 75.15 $ 3,006.0

#1-5
Short Sleeve Male Dark Navy: Blauer 
Item #8446 $ 2,440.0 40 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 61 $ 2,440.0 $ 65.48 $ 2,619.200

#1-6
Long Sleeve Male Dark Navy: Blauer 
Item #8436 $ 2,600.0 40 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 65 $ 2,600.0 $ 71.85 $ 2,874.0

#1-7
Short Sleeve Female Dark Navy: 
Blauer Item #8446W $ 1,830.0 30 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 61 $ 1,830.0 $ 65.45 $ 1,963.5

0 0 0
$ 0 $ 0 $ 0

Fairfield Uniform 
Company Horwitz Uniforms

New England 
Uniform Co. LLC

$ 58,571.0 $ 51,738.0 $ 102,550.2



#1-8
Long Sleeve Female Dark Navy: 
Blauer Item #8436W $ 1,950.0 30 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Blauer Brand by Cerified Dealer. 
On Site Measure No Bid No Bid $ 65 $ 1,950.0 $ 71.85 $ 2,155.5

#1-9
Short Sleeve Male White: Fecheimer 
Item #95R66 $ 540 12 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Fecheimer Brand by Certified 
Dealer. On Site Measure. $ 50 $ 600 $ 45 $ 540 $ 45 $ 540

#1-10
Long Sleeve Male White: Fecheimer 
Item #45W66 $ 576 12 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Fecheimer Brand by Certified 
Dealer. On Site Measure. $ 53 $ 636 $ 48 $ 576 $ 49 $ 588

#1-11
Short Sleeve Female White: 
Fecheimer Item #152R66 $ 540 12 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Fecheimer Brand by Certified 
Dealer. On Site Measure. $ 50 $ 600 $ 45 $ 540 $ 45 $ 540



#1-12
Long Sleeve Female White: 
Fecheimer Item #102W66 $ 576 12 EACH

Addition of department 
patches provided by vendor. 
Addition of Chevrons 
provided by vendor where 
indicated by Sergeant rank. 
Addition of Motorcycle 
emblems provided by 
department where 
indicated. Nametag Tab. 
Badge Tab. Epaulettes

Fecheimer Brand by Certified 
Dealer. On Site Measure. $ 53 $ 636 $ 48 $ 576 $ 49 $ 588

#1-13 3" Sergeant Chevron Emblems $ 80.0 50 EACH
Royal Blue/White/Black. 
Rayon/Polyester. Heros Pride or equivalent $ 3.5 $ 175.0 $ 1.6 $ 80.0 $ 2.25 $ 112.5

#1-14 Baseball Cap: FlexFit Original $ 0 300 EACH

Color Dark Navy. Stretch 6 
Panel Fitted Style with 
Curved Visor and Mid 
Profile.  Direct embroidery of 
NHPD Badge in gold 
centered on front approx 2" 
high. Letters NHPD direct 
embroidered in gold 
centered on back of hat 
approx 1/2" high. SEE 
ATTACHED ADDENDUM.

One completed sample may be 
requested. Order will be split 
between Sizes S/M & L/XL and 
Youth if available. $ 27 $ 8,100.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 24 $ 7,200.0

#1-15
Armor Skin XP Wool Vest Cover: 
Blauer Item #8470-1 $ 1,850.0 25 EACH

Color Dark Navy. 
Accommodates the wear of 
body camera.

All Sizes to be available by 
Certified Blauer Dealer. May 
require on site fitting. No Bid No Bid $ 74 $ 1,850.0 $ 74 $ 1,850.0

#1-16
Bomber Jacket: Blauer Style #9810Z 
with zip out liner. $ 5,200.0 40 EACH

Color Dark Navy. Badge Tab 
Left Chest. Name Tab Right 
Chest. Silver P-Buttons at 
Shoulder Epaulettes. 
Department Emblems to 
both sleeves. Sergeant 
chevrons attached as 
specified. x No Bid No Bid $ 130 $ 5,200.0 $ 134 $ 5,360.0



#1-17

Hi-Visibility Parka w/Fleece Jacket 
liner: Spiewak Item #S588VT with 
S318Z. $ 0 20 EACH

Color Hi-Viz Yellow & Navy 
Fleece. BOTH GARMENTS: 
Epaulettes. Department 
Emblems to both sleeves. 
Sergeant chevrons attached 
as specified. Badge Tab on 
Left Chest. Matching color 
Nametape w/ First Intial & 
Last Name on Right Chest. 
Centered on Back NEW 
HAVEN line 1 POLICE line 2 in 
approx. 2 1/2" high silver 
reflective letters. All Size 
Ranges.

ANSI regulated reflective 
lettering standards. $ 272 $ 5,440.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 246 $ 4,920.0

#1-18

Hi-Visibility Parka w/Reversible 
Jacket liner: Spiewak Item #S588VT 
with S318ZXV. $ 0 12 EACH

Color Hi-Viz Yellow & Navy. 
BOTH GARMENTS: 
Epaulettes. Department 
Emblems to both sleeves. 
Sergeant chevrons attached 
as specified. Badge Tab on 
Left Chest. Matching color 
Nametape w/ First Intial & 
Last Name on Right Chest.                                            
S588VT Back: Centered NEW 
HAVEN line 1 POLICE line 2 in 
approx. 2 1/2" high silver 
reflective letters.Line 1 
arched over Line 2. S318ZXV 
Hi-Viz Side on Back: 
Centered POLICE in silver 
letters approx. 3 3/4" high.  
All Size Ranges.

ANSI regulated reflective 
lettering standards. On site $ 307 $ 3,684.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 356 $ 4,272.0

#1-19 Fleece Jacket: Spiewak Item #S318Z. $ 0 20 EACH

Color Navy. Epaulettes. 
Department Emblems to 
both sleeves. Sergeant 
chevrons attached as 
specified. Badge Tab on Left 
Chest. Matching color 
Nametape w/ First Intial & 
Last Name on Right Chest. 
Centered on Back NEW 
HAVEN line 1 POLICE line 2 in 
approx. 2 1/2" silver 
reflective letters. All Size 
Ranges.

ANSI regulated reflective 
lettering standards. $ 110 $ 2,200.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 124.5 $ 2,490.0



#1-20
Hi-Visibility Reversible Jacket: 
Spiewak Item #S318ZXV. $ 0 20 EACH

Color Hi-Viz Yellow & Navy. 
Both Sides: Epaulettes. 
Department Emblems to 
both sleeves. Sergeant 
chevrons attached as 
specified. Badge Tab on Left 
Chest. Matching color 
Nametape w/ First Intial & 
Last Name on Right Chest.                                            
S588VT Back: Centered NEW 
HAVEN line 1 POLICE line 2 in 
approx. 2 1/2" high silver 
reflective letters.Line 1 
arched over Line 2. S318ZXV 
Hi-Viz Side on Back: 
Centered POLICE in silver 
letters approx. 3 3/4" high. 
All Size Ranges.

ANSI regulated reflective 
lettering standards. $ 168 $ 3,360.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 168.5 $ 3,370.0

#1-21
Hi-Visiblity Traffic Polo: Blauer Item 
#8137 $ 2,040.0 30 EACH

Color HI-Vis Yellow. 
Department Emblems to 
both sleeves. Sergeant 
chevrons attached as 
specified. New Haven Police 
Badge in corresponding 
Rank/Color/True Size with 
individual badge numbers 
embroidered on Left Chest. 
Matching color First Intial & 
Last Name embroidered on 
Right Chest. Centered 3" 
high POLICE in reflective 
lettering meeting ANSI 
regulation. Sizes XSmall 
through 5XLarge SEE 
ATTACHED ADDENDUM FOR 
DETECTIVE BADGE DESIGN.

ANSI regulated reflective 
lettering standards. Rank of 
Detective has NY Style Detective 
Badge. No Bid No Bid $ 68 $ 2,040.0 $ 92 $ 2,760.0



#1-22
Patrol Polo Shirt: 5.11 Item #71049 
Men. Item #61165 Women. $ 0 50 EACH

Color Dark Navy and White, 
to be indicated at time of 
order. Note: 95% of order 
will require Color Dark Navy. 
White only available for 
ranks of Lieutenant, Captain, 
Asst Chief, Chief to be 
specified at time of order. 
Department Emblems to 
both sleeves. Sergeant 
chevrons attached as 
specified. New Haven Police 
Badge in corresponding 
Rank/Color/True Size with 
individual badge numbers 
embroidered on Left Chest. 
Matching color First Intial & 
Last Name embroidered on 
Right Chest. Centered 3" 
high POLICE in reflective 
lettering meeting ANSI 
regulation. Sizes XSmall 
through 5XLarge and 
Womens Size Options. SEE 
ATTACHED ADDENDUM FOR 
DETECTIVE BADGE DESIGN.

ANSI regulated reflective 
lettering standards. Rank of 
Detective has NY Style Detective 
Badge. $ 63 $ 3,150.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 70 $ 3,500.0



#1-23

Plainclothes Short Sleeve Polo Shirt: 
5.11 Item #71049 Men. Item #61165 
Women. $ 0 12 EACH

Color Dark Navy and White. 
First Initial Last Name Badge 
Number embroidered on 
Right Chest in Gold lettering. 
Detective Shirts Gold badge 
embroidered with "ISD" 
inside number location on 
Left Chest. All Other Ranks 
Gold badge with 
corresponding rank  inside 
number location on Left 
Chest. All badges to be 
embroidered true size. Sizes 
XSmall through 5XLarge and 
Womens Size Options. Note: 
95% of order will require 
Color Dark Navy. White only 
available for ranks of 
Lieutenant, Captain, Asst 
Chief, Chief to be specified 
at time of order.SEE 
ATTACHED ADDENDUM FOR 
DETECTIVE BADGE DESIGN.

Badge images and acceptable 
embroidery samples available 
upon request. On Site Fitting 
May Apply. $ 52 $ 624 $ 0 $ 0 $ 60 $ 720



#1-24
Plainclothes Long Sleeve Polo Shirt: 
5.11 Item #72049. $ 0 12 EACH

Color Dark Navy and White. 
First Initial Last Name Badge 
Number embroidered on 
Right Chest in Gold lettering. 
Detective Shirts Gold badge 
embroidered with "ISD" 
inside number location on 
Left Chest. All Other Ranks 
Gold badge with 
corresponding rank  inside 
number location on Left 
Chest. All badges to be 
embroidered true size. Sizes 
XSmall through 5XLarge. 
Note: 95% of order will 
require Color Dark Navy. 
White only available for 
ranks of Lieutenant, Captain, 
Asst Chief, Chief to be 
specified at time of order. 
SEE ATTACHED ADDENDUM 
FOR DETECTIVE BADGE 
DESIGN.

Badge images and acceptable 
embroidery samples available 
upon request. On Site Fitting 
May Apply. $ 54 $ 648 $ 0 $ 0 $ 64 $ 768

#1-25
Unit Polo Shirt. 5.11 Item #41180 
Men and Item #61173 Women. $ 0 24 EACH

Color to be determined. One 
line of embroidery on Right 
Chest to be determined. Two 
(2) to (4) lines of embroidery 
for Unit identification to be 
determined. Lettering color 
to be determined. On Site Fitting May Apply. $ 46 $ 1,104.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 64 $ 1,536.0

#1-26

Ties: Samuel Broome Item #45055 
14 1/2", Item #45015 18", Item 
#45045 20", Item #45054 22" $ 240 60 EACH

Available in Navy and Black 
in the assorted lengths to be 
determined. 3" wide with 
buttonhole. Polyester/Wool 
blend.

Alternate Brands open for 
review in similar fabric content. 
Order will be split between 
lengths. $ 6 $ 360 $ 4 $ 240 $ 9 $ 540

#1-27 Turtleneck: Blauer Item #8100X $ 1,150.0 50 EACH

Color Dark Navy. 
Embroidered "NHPD" in 
overall 3/4" high x 1 1/2" 
length gold letters on left 
front of collar. Sizes XSmall 
through 4XLarge. Certified Dealer. No Bid No Bid $ 23 $ 1,150.0 $ 26.95 $ 1,347.5



#1-28
Mock Turtleneck: Elbeco UFX Base 
Layer Item #8924 $ 1,400.0 50 EACH

Color Midnight Navy. 
Embroidered "NHPD" on 
front left collar in gold 
letters overall 3/4" high x 1 
1/2" length. Sizes XSmall 
through 4XLarge. Certified Dealer. $ 42 $ 2,100.0 $ 31 $ 1,550.0 $ 28 $ 1,400.0

#1-29
8 Point Hat: Keystone L3 with Mesh 
Braid. $ 1,600.0 50 EACH

Color Dark Navy. Hat 
Braid/Rank Band to be Black 
Patent or 3/8" Gold or 1/2" 
Gold as ordered. Finished 
with Gold P-Buttons. All 
Sizes. x $ 38 $ 1,900.0 $ 32 $ 1,600.0 $ 48 $ 2,400.0

#1-30 Chevron Emblems $ 80.0 50 EACH

3" wide Sergeant Chevrons. 
Royal Blue with White Edge 
on Black Background. x $ 3.5 $ 175.0 $ 1.6 $ 80.0 $ 4 $ 200

#1-31
8 Point Chief Hat: Midway or 
Comparable Brand $ 126 3 EACH

Color Navy. Hat frame 
finished with velvet/velvet-
like material, 1/2" Gold Wire 
Strap, Gold P-Buttons, Army 
Gold Bullion on Felt Finished 
Visor. No patent leather 
materials in design. SEE 
ATTACHED ADDENDUM. x $ 91 $ 273 $ 42 $ 126 $ 110 $ 330

#1-32
Field Training Pin: Blackinton Style 
#10 $ 168 24 EACH

Double backed "F.T.O" pin in 
Style #10 (5/16" high letters) x $ 15 $ 360 $ 7 $ 168 $ 11 $ 264

#1-33 Rifle Operator Pin: Center Mass $ 240 24 EACH
Antique Gold Finish Patrol 
Rifle Pin. x $ 24 $ 576 $ 10 $ 240 No Bid No Bid

#1-34
Negotiator Pin: Blackinton or 
Comparable $ 384 24 EACH

Negotiator Pin Knight with 
Lightning Bolt and Laurel.  
Smooth Goldtone Finish with 
Black Enamel. Approx. 1" 
high x 1" wide. x $ 35 $ 840 $ 16 $ 384 No Bid No Bid

#1-35 Badge Shroud $ 200 100 EACH
3/4" wide Thin Blue Line 
shroud x $ 2.5 $ 250.0 $ 2 $ 200 No Bid No Bid

#1-36 Velcro Nametape $ 2,100.0 300 EACH

Color Black. Sewn and cut 
with clean finished edges. 4" 
wide x 1" high with 
determined wording in 3/8" 
high in Silver or Gold thread 
as indicated. Example of 
wording: J.SMITH 134 x $ 7 $ 2,100.0 $ 10 $ 3,000.0 $ 12 $ 3,600.0



#1-37 Nametape $ 1,800.0 300 EACH

Color Black. Sewn and cut 
with clean finished edges. 5" 
wide x 1" high with 
determined wording in 1/2" 
high in specified color thread 
as indicated. x $ 6 $ 1,800.0 $ 8 $ 2,400.0 $ 9 $ 2,700.0

#1-38 Raincoat: 5.11 Item #48125 $ 0 75 EACH

Color Black and Hi-Visiblity 
Yellow. Sizes Small through 
3XLarge. x $ 111 $ 8,325.0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 110 $ 8,250.0

#1-39
Formal Dress Jackets-Officer & 
Sergeant: Brand Hope Uniform $ 6,608.0 28 EACH

Custom Fit Jacket.Four 
button, single breasted, 
peaked lapels, form fitting – 
cut snug at waist, flare in 
skirt (Sam Browne belt will 
be worn). Double bi-swing 
back with center vent. SEE 
ATTACHED ADDENDUM FOR 
COMPLETE SPECIFICATIONS.

Alternate Brands open for 
review in similar fabric content. 
Fabric sample must be 
submitted. Sample Jacket 
available for review. $ 260 $ 7,280.0 $ 236 $ 6,608.0 $ 531 $ 14,868.0

#1-40
Formal Dress Jackets-Lieutenant & 
Above: Brand Hope Uniform $ 1,230.0 5 EACH

Custom Fit Jacket. Four 
button, single breasted, 
peaked lapels, semi-form 
fitting. To be cut with 
sufficient allowance for gun 
to be worn under coat. 
Double bi-swing back with 2 
side vents. SEE ATTACHED 
ADDENDUM FOR COMPLETE 
SPECIFICATIONS.

Alternate Brands open for 
review in similar fabric content. 
Fabric sample must be 
submitted. Sample Jacket 
available for review. $ 255 $ 1,275.0 $ 246 $ 1,230.0 $ 531 $ 2,655.0
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