
Solicitation Name: Police Handguns & Accessories
Solicitation#: 70195106 Total Cost
Closed: 12/05/2019 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest Model/Part
# Color/Finish Quantity
Re Unit
of
MeasuUnit
Price Total
Cost Unit
Price Total
Cost Unit
Price Total
Cost

1
#1-1 Glock 19 Gen 5 MOS $ 225,225.0Glock #PA195S302MOBlack 450 each No Bid No Bid $ 500.5 $ 225,225.0 $ 500.5 $ 225,225.0
2

#2-1

Handgun Optic Trijicon RMR06 Type 2 
Adjustable LED Sight (3.25moa dot) with 
Battery 5yr, CR2032 $ 174,101.0Trijicon #RM06-C-700         Black 429 each $ 416.83 $ 178,820.07$ 405.83 $ 174,101.07$ 447 $ 191,763.0

#2-2

Handgun Optic Trijicon RMR06 Type 2 
Adjustable LED Sight (3.25moa dot) with 
Battery 5yr, CR2032 $ 9,130.800Trijicon #RM06-C-700         (FDE) Flat Dark Earth 21 each $ 445.83 $ 9,362.43 $ 434.8 $ 9,130.8000$ 480 $ 10,080.0

3

#3-1
Glock AmeriGlo Suppressor/Optic Height 
Sight Set GL-511 $ 20,745.0 AmeriGlo # GL-511, M        front only green tritium          450 each No Bid No Bid $ 46.1 $ 20,745.0 $ 60 $ 27,000.0

#3-2
Glock AmeriGlo Suppressor/Optic Height 
Sight Set GL-511 $ 968.1 AmeriGlo # GL-511, M        front only green tritium          21 each No Bid No Bid $ 46.1 $ 968.1 $ 60 $ 1,260.0

4

#4-1

Taran Tactical Innovations (TTI) Handgun 
Base Plate For Glock Magazines + 4/5 
Rounds, GBP940C-6 $ 0 Taran Tactical Innova           Coyote Bronze 63 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5

#5-1

Safariland 6360RDS holster Model 
6360RDS ALS®/SLS Mid-Ride, Level III 
Retention™ Duty Holster/ $ 55,880.0 Right Hand #6360RDS                 Black/Hardshell STX/ST                 440 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 127 $ 55,880.0

#5-2

Safariland 7360 holster fox X300/TLR1 
Model 7360 7TS™ ALS®/SLS Mid-Ride, 
Level III Retention™ Duty Holster $ 51,920.0 Right Hand #7360283             Black/Safariseven/Plain             440 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 118 $ 51,920.0

#5-3

Safariland 6395RDS holster Model 
6395RDS ALS® Low-Ride Level I Retention™ 
Duty Holster $ 2,675.0 Right Hand #6395RDS                 Multicam/Hardshell stx              25 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 107 $ 2,675.0

6

#6-1

Streamlight TLR1 HL 800 Lumen, TLR-1 HL 
Including Rail Locating Keys and lithium 
batteries. Boxed. $ 47,471.6 Streamlight #69260, U              Black 440 each box $ 124.83 $ 54,925.2 $ 107.89 $ 47,471.6 $ 122 $ 53,680.0

#6-2
Surefire X300UB 1000 Lumen packaged 
with Battery $ 4,800.0 Surefire #0848713249              Tan 25 each $ 208.83 $ 5,220.75 $ 192 $ 4,800.0 $ 217 $ 5,425.0

7
#7-1 Glock 22 GEN 3 RTF with 3 Magazines $ -140980 x Black 532 credit No Bid No Bid $ 250.01 $ 133,005.32$ -265 $ -140980
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