
Solicitation Name: Latex Printing Supplies
Solicitation #70205010 Total Cost
Closed: July 9, 2020 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest  QuanƟtyRequired  UnitofMeasure  UnitPrice  TotalCost  UnitPrice  TotalCost

1
#1-1 1LH38A#B1K HP L315 54" Latex Printer & CuƩer with 1 year on site warranty thru HP. $ 14,195.0 1 Each $ 14,195.0 $ 14,195.0 No Bid No Bid
2

#2-1
CZ682A HP 831A 775-ml Black Latex 
Ink Cartridge $ 675 5 Cartrige $ 135 $ 675 $ 202.95 $ 1,014.75

#2-2
CZ683A HP 831A 775-ml Cyan Latex 
Ink Cartridge $ 675 5 Cartrige $ 135 $ 675 $ 202.95 $ 1,014.75

#2-3
CZ684A HP 831A 775-ml Magenta 
Latex Ink Cartridge $ 675 5 Cartrige $ 135 $ 675 $ 202.95 $ 1,014.75

#2-4
CZ685A HP 831A 775-ml Yellow Latex 
Ink Cartridge $ 675 5 Cartrige $ 135 $ 675 $ 202.95 $ 1,014.75

#2-5
CZ686A HP 831A 775-ml Light Cyan 
Latex Ink Cartridge $ 675 5 Cartrige $ 135 $ 675 $ 202.95 $ 1,014.75

#2-6
CZ687A HP 831A 775-ml Light 
Magenta Latex Ink Cartridge $ 675 5 Cartrige $ 135 $ 675 $ 202.95 $ 1,014.75

#2-7
CZ706A HP 831 775-ml Latex 
Optimizer Ink Cartridge $ 675 5 Cartrige $ 135 $ 675 $ 202.95 $ 1,014.75

#2-8
CZ681A HP 831 Latex Maintenance 
Cartridge $ 653.45 5 Cartrige $ 130.69 $ 653.45 $ 224.35 $ 1,121.75

#2-9 HP 831 Cyan/Black Latex Printhead $ 206.76 2 Each $ 103.38 $ 206.76 $ 188.65 $ 377.3

#2-10
HP 831 Yellow/Magenta Latex 
Printhead $ 206.76 2 Each $ 103.38 $ 206.76 $ 188.65 $ 377.3

#2-11
HP 831 Light Magenta/Light Cyan 
Latex Printhead $ 206.76 2 Each $ 103.38 $ 206.76 $ 188.65 $ 377.3

#2-12 HP 831 Latex Optimizer Printhead $ 206.76 2 Each $ 103.38 $ 206.76 $ 188.65 $ 377.3
3

$ 0 $ 0

Lindenmeyr Munroe MGD GRAPHICS INC
$ 37,049.98999999999$ 25,453.449999999997

0 0
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#3-1
48" x 82' 14 mil TexWalk PVC Vinyl 
Reinforced Rem/Repos Adh $ 6,396.0 15 Roll $ 426.4 $ 6,396.0 $ 800.25 $ 12,003.75

#3-2
54" x 100' 6 Mil WallMark white 
matte  Wall adhesive $ 2,160.0 10 Roll $ 216 $ 2,160.0 $ 371.55 $ 3,715.5

#3-3
54" x 150'  4.5 Mil - Linroe White Vinyl  
Hi-Gloss Perm Adh $ 1,687.5 10 Roll $ 168.75 $ 1,687.5 No Bid No Bid

#3-4
54" x 150'  4.5 Mil - Linroe White Vinyl 
Matte Perm Adh $ 1,687.5 10 Roll $ 168.75 $ 1,687.5 No Bid No Bid

#3-5
54" x 100' 6 Mil Concept Semi-Rigid 
Vinyl Gloss Rem Adhesive $ 1,575.0 10 Roll $ 157.5 $ 1,575.0 No Bid No Bid

#3-6
38" x 164' 13 oz 1000D dtec Scrim 
Banner (Gloss/Matte) $ 1,298.5 10 Roll $ 129.85 $ 1,298.5 No Bid No Bid

#3-7
54" x 164' 13 oz 1000D dtec Scrim 
Banner (Gloss/Matte) $ 1,845.0 10 Roll $ 184.5 $ 1,845.0 No Bid No Bid


