
Solicitation #: 70195108 Total Cost
Closed: 12/19/2019 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest Item/Description Quantity
Re Unit
of
MeasuUnit
Price Total
Cost Unit
Price Total
Cost Unit
Price Total
Cost Unit
Price Total
Cost

1

#1-1 TO10 $ 10,435.47
26" Auto Micro-Rider 
Floor Scrubber 1 EA $ 12,258.4 $ 12,258.4 $ 16,830.0 $ 16,830.0 $ 10,435.47$ 10,435.47 $ 10,435.47$ 10,435.47

#1-2 TO11 $ 8,953.14
28" Walk-Behind Floor 
Scrubber 1 EA $ 10,626.07$ 10,626.07 $ 12,814.22$ 12,814.22 $ 8,953.14 $ 8,953.14 $ 8,953.14 $ 8,953.14

#1-3 TO12 $ 4,472.23
20" Walk-Behind Floor 
Scrubber 1 EA $ 6,133.4 $ 6,133.4 $ 8,018.37 $ 8,018.37 $ 4,472.23 $ 4,472.23 $ 4,472.23 $ 4,472.23

#1-4 TO13 $ 1,029.22 Wet-Dry Vacuum 2 EA $ 670.6799 $ 1,341.36 $ 850 $ 1,700.0 $ 514.61 $ 1,029.22 $ 514.61 $ 1,029.22

#1-5 TO14 $ 1,426.6
Battery Walk-Behind 
Brush 1 EA $ 1,426.6 $ 1,426.6 $ 7,967.61 $ 7,967.61 $ 6,266.47 $ 6,266.47 $ 6,266.47 $ 6,266.47

#1-6 TO15 $ 145.93
Commercial Dryer/Air 
Mover 1 EA $ 247.8 $ 247.8 $ 222.31 $ 222.31 $ 145.93 $ 145.93 $ 145.93 $ 145.93

#1-7 TO16 $ 2,035.14 Cleaning Companion 1 EA $ 3,661.54 $ 3,661.54 $ 2,035.14 $ 2,035.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-8 TO17 $ 729.0 Backpack Vacuum 2 EA $ 415.53 $ 831.06 $ 364.5 $ 729.0 $ 375.44 $ 750.88 $ 375.44 $ 750.88
#1-9 TO18 $ 360 Upright Vacuum 3 EA $ 171.61 $ 514.83 $ 120 $ 360 $ 271.97 $ 815.91000$ 271.97 $ 815.9100000000001

#1-10 TO19 $ 1,088.11 Steam Cleaner w/Trolley 1 EA $ 3,821.18 $ 3,821.18 $ 1,688.04 $ 1,688.04 $ 1,088.11 $ 1,088.11 $ 1,088.11 $ 1,088.11
#1-11 TO20 $ 494.91 20" Stripping Machine 1 EA $ 670.6799 $ 670.68 $ 652.67 $ 652.67 $ 494.91 $ 494.91 $ 494.91 $ 494.91
#1-12 TO21 $ 195.94 Gas Hand Leaf Blower 1 EA $ 195.94 $ 195.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-13 TO22 $ 908.6 Gas Snow Blower 1 EA $ 908.6 $ 908.6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Solicitation Name:Barack H Obama University Magnet 

0 0 0 0
$ 0 $ 0 $ 0 $ 0

C&C Janitorial Hillyard, Inc. WB Mason Co B Mason Co - Alternate  
$ 42,637.46 $ 53,017.36 $ 34,452.27000000001 $ 34,452.27000000001
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